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STUDENT MEDICAL PROFESSIONAL & GENERAL LIABILITY 

COVERAGE 
 
 
In accordance with its indemnification policy, Michigan State 
University will support trustees, officers, faculty, and staff when 
acting in the performance of their assigned duties on behalf of 
the University.  This policy also applies to students while 
engaged in approved academic programs where they are 
enrolled, are registered and have received College approval.  
This would include a) activities that are an official component of 
the curriculum, including required and elective courses, b) 
approved preceptorships, and c) approved field placements in 
off-campus locations.  Students must be under the direction of 
the University, i.e., under the supervision of faculty in performing 
the services, and the performance of such services must be 
within the scope of their education/training.  Students are not 
covered when receiving pay for services or for non-MSU 
activities that are not approved field placements or 
preceptorships. 
 
 
Medical Professional and General Liability Coverage for students 
is provided by a self-insurance program with limits of $1 million 
per occurrence and $3 million aggregate. 
 
 
Questions may be directed to MSU Risk Management & 
Insurance at 517-355-5022 or riskmgmt@msu.edu. 
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MSU is an affirmative-action,  
equal-opportunity employer. 


